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Deborah Bracey - DNR

From: Clark, Erin K <erin.k.clark@exxonmobil.com> on behalf of Clark, Erin K
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 5:50 AM
To: Deborah Bracey - DNR; Holly Hill
Subject: RE: Form 9 Transfer - XTO Energy Inc #403111066 to Caerus Piceance LLC #403141549

Good Morning Deb, 

XTO Energy as the Selling Operator will file a Form 3, Financial Assurance Plan within ten (10) business days of Form 9 
approval.  Per Rule 702, Seller will then provide any required additional financial assurance as soon as practicable but no 
later than ninety (90) days from the Commission’s approval of the Form 3, Financial Assurance Plan. 

Thank you so much for your help with this! 

Thanks 

Erin Clark 
Lead Regulatory Coordinator, Central Business Unit 

From: Deborah Bracey ‐ DNR <deborah.bracey@state.co.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 4:49 PM 
To: Holly Hill <hhill@caerusoilandgas.com>; Clark, Erin K <erin.k.clark@exxonmobil.com> 
Subject: RE: Form 9 Transfer ‐ XTO Energy Inc #403111066 to Caerus Piceance LLC #403141549 

External Email ‐ Think Before You Click 

Hi Holly and Erin, 

Issues 1 and 2 are resolved.  There were no corrected spreadsheets for Wells and Facilities Transferred and Incidents 
Transferred for the Subsequent.  The Buyer Notified Local Govt Attestation does not reflect the correct Intent and 
Subsequent document numbers for this transfer.  Please email me with the correct documentation and I will upload it to 
the form.  Also, both parties need to accept the conditions of approval, please. 

Thanks, 
Deb 

From: Holly Hill <hhill@caerusoilandgas.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 3:21 PM 
To: Deborah Bracey ‐ DNR <deborah.bracey@state.co.us>; Erin.k.clark@exxonmobil.com 
Subject: RE: Form 9 Transfer ‐ XTO Energy Inc #403111066 to Caerus Piceance LLC #403141549 

Hi Deb – 
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