
FUEL USED

5: COND.  & CIRC

10: DEVIATION
11: WIRELINE LOG
12: RUN CSG & CMNT

14: NIPPLE UP BOP
15: TEST BOP

16: DRILL STEM TEST
17: PLUGBACK
18: SQUEEZE  CMNT

2: DRILLING

3: REAMING
4: CORING

6: TRIPS
7: LUBRICATE RIG
8: REPAIR RIG

9: C/O DRILL LINE

13: WAIT ON CEMENT

19: FISHING

20: DIR. WORK

DATE RIG NO.

RIG PHONE NUMBER

DAYS FR SPUD

JOB NO.

WELLNAME

OPERATOR

WEATHER

SPUD DATE / TIME

WATER SOURCE

OPERATIONS @ REPORT TIME

DEPTH INCL AZM

CREW  M / U MANHOURS PAST 24

ACCIDENTS  OR NEAR MISSES:

PROJECTED  TD

LAST INSPECTION

R
EP

O
R

T 
R

EM
A

R
K

S

DEVIATION SURVEYS

Total Hours

(Today /  Well)TIME BREAKDOWN

BIT# SIZE TYPE MAKE NOZZLES OUT @IN @ DRILLED HRS CONDITION R O PSERIAL #

B
IT

S

LENGTHNO.

STANDS

WT of COLLARS / DRILLSTRING

DRILLING ASSEMBLY ( BHA )

SINGLES

HOURS SINCE LAST INSPECTION

KELLY DOWN

TOTAL

DRILL PIPE
DIRECTIONS TO

MORNING REPORT JOB TYPE WELL TYPE

O.D.

DETAILS OF OPERATIONS IN SEQUENCEFROM TO HRS CODE

1: RIG UP / DOWN

BOILER #

HOURS

SIZE WEIGHT GRADE I.D. TJ O.D. THREAD # JNTS LENGTH IN HOLE ON RACK REPAIRS

D
R

LL
ST

R
G

Used Today

Used This Well

DELIVERED TODAY

On Hand

Fuel BrandR
IG

 F
U

EL

Time Mud Wt  IN /  OUT Funnel Vis Fl.  LossPV 10 S GEL

M
U

D
 M

TR SERIAL # HRS LAST
24

TOTAL
HRS

CUM.
WELL HRS

FOOTAGE
LAST 24

TOTAL
FOOTAGE

TODAY

RIG MANAGER

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS

BOP TEST DATE / PRESSURE

LAST CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH RIG COSTS

BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

DAILY

AVERAGE

CUMULATIVE

CUMULATIVE
DAYS

CUM. HRS

I.D.

WELL

STATE JOB START DATE DAYS ON JOB EST. RELEASE

G.P.S.   COORDINATES

CROWN-O-MATIC  CHECKED

OPERATIONS NEXT 24 HRS

CURRENT  DEPTH FOOTAGE LAST 24 PEN. RATE ROT. HRS MAX. GAS BCKGR GAS CONN. GAS TRIP GAS

# STOP CARDS

# OF JSA's

NEXT CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH

DAILY CUM.

FILT  CKYLD PT 10 M GEL

RENTALS & R

EN
G

IN
ES

Co. No.

HRS TODAY

HRS LAST CHGE

HRS ON WELL

LOCATION

DRILL STRING REMARKS

FUEL ADDED TO MUD
TODAY

EXTRA  CREWS /  WHY? BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

CUM.
MUD COSTS

CHANGED

HOOKLOAD PICKUP WEIGHT SLACKOFF ROTATING

RIG SAFETY DAYS

INSPECTION  BY / TITLE

SAFETY RATE

OFFICE NOTIFIED

FROM TO CODE RPM W.O.B.
DEPTH  DRILLED

LAST MEETING DATE

RELEASE DATE / TIME

AVERAGE KVA

DISTRIBUTOR
BLOWDOWN
VOLUMES

M
U

D
O

PS
SA

FE
TY

HTHP FL HTTP FC

TI
M

E 
LO

G

ROTARY TORQUE

pH MF PF CALCIUM CHLORIDES% SOLIDS % LCM % OIL% SAND % H2OMud Type

SHAKER TYPE SCREENSCENTRIFUGES

PU
M

PS
R

EN
TA

L 
IT

EM
S

OPERATORS REPRESENTATIVE

COUNTY / PARISH

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CO. MAN PH NO.

B
O

IL
ER

STDBY HRLYDESCRIPTION DAY RT

Depth GPM PRESSURE
Pump 1

Liner SPM
Pump 2

Liner SPM
Pump 3

Liner SPM
Pump 4

Liner SPM Pump 1
Pump 2

Pump 3
Pump 4

TYPE STROKE HRS Total HRS MAX PSI KILL (SPM)Manufacturer SPR
Kill Rate

CAPSTAR DRILLING, LP (WY) 2020-09-02 312 Re-Entry

AMOCO-WESTAN-CAVANAUGH#1 NE NE SEC 08, T004S, R64W 08/18/20 19:45 8300.00

CRESTONE PEAK RESOURCES, LLC Adams CO 08/16/20 12:00 16.19

13.86

08/28/20

TRACY EKLUND 307-797-8547 DEREK DUPEE 720-398-1700 09/01/20 16:30 78 Degrees & Cloudy

Clean Mud tank, Rig Down. Rig released at 16:30 hrs on 9/1/2020 Rig Down

None 6 1876 N 39.723 W -104.567

Cementing//Nipple Down//Forklift Ops 0 08/31/20 08/31/20 06:00

08/18/20 CORY C - MNGR 44.00

08/21/20 250/3000

08/26/20 08:00 - 90 SEC

08/26/20 22:00 - 90 SEC

8086.00 0.00 0.00

 -

7.00 644.54

Water/Polymer

Fluid Pro Mongoose 2X140 2X120 No 1.00 1.00

06:00 07:00 1.00 13 WAIT ON CEMENT
07:00 08:00 1.00 11 R/U WIRE LINE HOLD SAFTY MEETING RUN IN AND PERF
08:00 08:30 0.50 6 T.I.H. 10 JOINTS
08:30 09:00 0.50 5 CIRCULATE BACKSIDE AND R/U CEMENTERS
09:00 11:00 2.00 18 HOLD SAFTY MEETING AND SQUEEZE CEMENT PLUG #7 FROM 313-0' 206 SKS 26 BBLS
11:00 12:00 1.00 6 L.D.D.P.
12:00 14:30 2.50 14 NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P.
14:30 16:30 2.00 21 Clean Mud tank, Rig Down. Rig released at 16:30 hrs on 9/1/2020

16.00
1.50

66.25

0.50 70.50
1.50 65.25

2.50
37.00
1.00

1.00 4.50
18.00

1.00 39.00
2.50 21.50

18.00

2.00 2.00

21: 2.00 7.50
22:
23:
Other

10.50 370.50

 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

4.00 14.00 S-135 4.753.5 X/H 238 238 0 0 Rig=
(8) 6.5" DC's

1800.00
200.00

8036.00
#2 Dyed

0
0

622.25

Trucks scheduled for 7AM.

From Watkins Co head
south on exit295. Drive 1
turn east , drile 1.1 mile
turn south , Drive 1 mile
east turn north
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FUEL USED

5: COND.  & CIRC

10: DEVIATION
11: WIRELINE LOG
12: RUN CSG & CMNT

14: NIPPLE UP BOP
15: TEST BOP

16: DRILL STEM TEST
17: PLUGBACK
18: SQUEEZE  CMNT

2: DRILLING

3: REAMING
4: CORING

6: TRIPS
7: LUBRICATE RIG
8: REPAIR RIG

9: C/O DRILL LINE

13: WAIT ON CEMENT

19: FISHING

20: DIR. WORK

DATE RIG NO.

RIG PHONE NUMBER

DAYS FR SPUD

JOB NO.

WELLNAME

OPERATOR

WEATHER

SPUD DATE / TIME

WATER SOURCE

OPERATIONS @ REPORT TIME

DEPTH INCL AZM

CREW  M / U MANHOURS PAST 24

ACCIDENTS  OR NEAR MISSES:

PROJECTED  TD

LAST INSPECTION

R
EP

O
R

T 
R

EM
A

R
K

S

DEVIATION SURVEYS

Total Hours

(Today /  Well)TIME BREAKDOWN

BIT# SIZE TYPE MAKE NOZZLES OUT @IN @ DRILLED HRS CONDITION R O PSERIAL #

B
IT

S

LENGTHNO.

STANDS

WT of COLLARS / DRILLSTRING

DRILLING ASSEMBLY ( BHA )

SINGLES

HOURS SINCE LAST INSPECTION

KELLY DOWN

TOTAL

DRILL PIPE
DIRECTIONS TO

MORNING REPORT JOB TYPE WELL TYPE

O.D.

DETAILS OF OPERATIONS IN SEQUENCEFROM TO HRS CODE

1: RIG UP / DOWN

BOILER #

HOURS

SIZE WEIGHT GRADE I.D. TJ O.D. THREAD # JNTS LENGTH IN HOLE ON RACK REPAIRS

D
R

LL
ST

R
G

Used Today

Used This Well

DELIVERED TODAY

On Hand

Fuel BrandR
IG

 F
U

EL

Time Mud Wt  IN /  OUT Funnel Vis Fl.  LossPV 10 S GEL

M
U

D
 M

TR SERIAL # HRS LAST
24

TOTAL
HRS

CUM.
WELL HRS

FOOTAGE
LAST 24

TOTAL
FOOTAGE

TODAY

RIG MANAGER

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS

BOP TEST DATE / PRESSURE

LAST CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH RIG COSTS

BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

DAILY

AVERAGE

CUMULATIVE

CUMULATIVE
DAYS

CUM. HRS

I.D.

WELL

STATE JOB START DATE DAYS ON JOB EST. RELEASE

G.P.S.   COORDINATES

CROWN-O-MATIC  CHECKED

OPERATIONS NEXT 24 HRS

CURRENT  DEPTH FOOTAGE LAST 24 PEN. RATE ROT. HRS MAX. GAS BCKGR GAS CONN. GAS TRIP GAS

# STOP CARDS

# OF JSA's

NEXT CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH

DAILY CUM.

FILT  CKYLD PT 10 M GEL

RENTALS & R

EN
G

IN
ES

Co. No.

HRS TODAY

HRS LAST CHGE

HRS ON WELL

LOCATION

DRILL STRING REMARKS

FUEL ADDED TO MUD
TODAY

EXTRA  CREWS /  WHY? BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

CUM.
MUD COSTS

CHANGED

HOOKLOAD PICKUP WEIGHT SLACKOFF ROTATING

RIG SAFETY DAYS

INSPECTION  BY / TITLE

SAFETY RATE

OFFICE NOTIFIED

FROM TO CODE RPM W.O.B.
DEPTH  DRILLED

LAST MEETING DATE

RELEASE DATE / TIME

AVERAGE KVA

DISTRIBUTOR
BLOWDOWN
VOLUMES

M
U

D
O

PS
SA

FE
TY

HTHP FL HTTP FC

TI
M

E 
LO

G

ROTARY TORQUE

pH MF PF CALCIUM CHLORIDES% SOLIDS % LCM % OIL% SAND % H2OMud Type

SHAKER TYPE SCREENSCENTRIFUGES

PU
M

PS
R

EN
TA

L 
IT

EM
S

OPERATORS REPRESENTATIVE

COUNTY / PARISH

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CO. MAN PH NO.

B
O

IL
ER

STDBY HRLYDESCRIPTION DAY RT

Depth GPM PRESSURE
Pump 1

Liner SPM
Pump 2

Liner SPM
Pump 3

Liner SPM
Pump 4

Liner SPM Pump 1
Pump 2

Pump 3
Pump 4

TYPE STROKE HRS Total HRS MAX PSI KILL (SPM)Manufacturer SPR
Kill Rate

CAPSTAR DRILLING, LP (WY) 2020-09-01 312 Re-Entry

AMOCO-WESTAN-CAVANAUGH#1 NE NE SEC 08, T004S, R64W 08/18/20 19:45 8300.00

CRESTONE PEAK RESOURCES, LLC Adams CO 08/16/20 12:00 15.75

13.43

08/28/20

TRACY EKLUND 307-797-8547 DEREK DUPEE 720-398-1700 53 Degrees & Cloudy

WAIT ON CEMENT Run Wireline//Perforate and Squeeze

None 6 1875 N 39.7229 W -104.567

Tong & Boom Ops//Forklift Ops//Cementing//Teamwork 0 08/31/20 08/31/20 06:00

08/18/20 CORY C - MNGR 100.00

08/21/20 250/3000

08/26/20 08:00 - 90 SEC

08/26/20 22:00 - 90 SEC

8086.00 0.00

 -

7.00 644.54

Water/Polymer

Fluid Pro Mongoose 2X140 2X120 No

06:00 09:30 3.50 13 WAIT ON CEMENT//TIH TAG@ 1448' SET 5K ON IT
09:30 10:00 0.50 5 CONDITION MUD & CIRCULATE
10:00 11:00 1.00 12 CEMENT PLUG #4 @ 1429-690'
11:00 13:00 2.00 6 T.O.O.H.
13:00 17:00 4.00 13 WOC//TIH TAG PLUG#4@ 690' SET 5.6K ON IT
17:00 18:00 1.00 5 CONDITION MUD & CIRCULATE
18:00 18:30 0.50 12 CEMENT PLUG #5 @ 690-643'
18:30 23:00 4.50 13 W.O.C.,T.O.H. TO 350', CIRC, L.D.D.P.,
23:00 00:00 1.00 11 PJSM W/ STS WIRELINE/ RIG AND RUN PERF GUN TO 315', .70 SHOT, 4 SHOT/FT, 2FT

SHOT, TOTAL OF 8 SHOTS, NO SHOT TAGED CEMENT @647'W/ WIERLINE
00:00 01:00 1.00 6 TIH 21 JOINTS TO 643'TAG CEMENT W/ DP @643'9K SET ON PLUG.
01:00 02:00 1.00 12 CEMENT PLUG #6 @ 643-344' 54SX 11BBLS OF 15.8 CEMENT DISPLACE W/ 4BBLS WATER
02:00 02:30 0.50 13 WOC, POOH TO 250' CIRCULATE PIPE, CONTINUE POOH.
02:30 06:00 3.50 13 WAIT ON CEMENT

16.00
1.50

66.25

1.50 70.00
3.00 63.75

2.50
37.00
1.00

1.00 3.50
2.50 18.00

16.00 38.00
19.00
18.00

21: 5.50
22:
23:
Other

24.00 360.00

 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

4.00 14.00 S-135 4.753.5 X/H 273 0 273 0 Rig= (8) 6.5
" DC's (238) 4" DP
Rental=
(6) 4.75" DC's
(35) 4" DP

2000.00
430.00

7836.00
#2 Dyed

0
0

622.25
JACOB BOLD PTSM TRIPPING IN HOLE//COM@ 0600//INSPECT DRILL
JACOB BOLD LINE AND BRAKES
COLE SHANDORF S.M. ON CEMENTING/ SCOPING BOOM/ TEST COM @ 1830,
COLE SHANDORF FUEL LP- 1200 DH- 800, 2000 TOTAL

WOC this morning.

From Watkins Co head
south on exit295. Drive 1
turn east , drile 1.1 mile
turn south , Drive 1 mile
east turn north

Revision 1 Page 1 of 1US 4.70.0



FUEL USED

5: COND.  & CIRC

10: DEVIATION
11: WIRELINE LOG
12: RUN CSG & CMNT

14: NIPPLE UP BOP
15: TEST BOP

16: DRILL STEM TEST
17: PLUGBACK
18: SQUEEZE  CMNT

2: DRILLING

3: REAMING
4: CORING

6: TRIPS
7: LUBRICATE RIG
8: REPAIR RIG

9: C/O DRILL LINE

13: WAIT ON CEMENT

19: FISHING

20: DIR. WORK

DATE RIG NO.

RIG PHONE NUMBER

DAYS FR SPUD

JOB NO.

WELLNAME

OPERATOR

WEATHER

SPUD DATE / TIME

WATER SOURCE

OPERATIONS @ REPORT TIME

DEPTH INCL AZM

CREW  M / U MANHOURS PAST 24

ACCIDENTS  OR NEAR MISSES:

PROJECTED  TD

LAST INSPECTION

R
EP

O
R

T 
R

EM
A

R
K

S

DEVIATION SURVEYS

Total Hours

(Today /  Well)TIME BREAKDOWN

BIT# SIZE TYPE MAKE NOZZLES OUT @IN @ DRILLED HRS CONDITION R O PSERIAL #

B
IT

S

LENGTHNO.

STANDS

WT of COLLARS / DRILLSTRING

DRILLING ASSEMBLY ( BHA )

SINGLES

HOURS SINCE LAST INSPECTION

KELLY DOWN

TOTAL

DRILL PIPE
DIRECTIONS TO

MORNING REPORT JOB TYPE WELL TYPE

O.D.

DETAILS OF OPERATIONS IN SEQUENCEFROM TO HRS CODE

1: RIG UP / DOWN

BOILER #

HOURS

SIZE WEIGHT GRADE I.D. TJ O.D. THREAD # JNTS LENGTH IN HOLE ON RACK REPAIRS

D
R

LL
ST

R
G

Used Today

Used This Well

DELIVERED TODAY

On Hand

Fuel BrandR
IG

 F
U

EL

Time Mud Wt  IN /  OUT Funnel Vis Fl.  LossPV 10 S GEL

M
U

D
 M

TR SERIAL # HRS LAST
24

TOTAL
HRS

CUM.
WELL HRS

FOOTAGE
LAST 24

TOTAL
FOOTAGE

TODAY

RIG MANAGER

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS

BOP TEST DATE / PRESSURE

LAST CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH RIG COSTS

BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

DAILY

AVERAGE

CUMULATIVE

CUMULATIVE
DAYS

CUM. HRS

I.D.

WELL

STATE JOB START DATE DAYS ON JOB EST. RELEASE

G.P.S.   COORDINATES

CROWN-O-MATIC  CHECKED

OPERATIONS NEXT 24 HRS

CURRENT  DEPTH FOOTAGE LAST 24 PEN. RATE ROT. HRS MAX. GAS BCKGR GAS CONN. GAS TRIP GAS

# STOP CARDS

# OF JSA's

NEXT CASING SIZE & SET DEPTH

DAILY CUM.

FILT  CKYLD PT 10 M GEL

RENTALS & R

EN
G

IN
ES

Co. No.

HRS TODAY

HRS LAST CHGE

HRS ON WELL

LOCATION

DRILL STRING REMARKS

FUEL ADDED TO MUD
TODAY

EXTRA  CREWS /  WHY? BOP DRILL  DATE / TIME

CUM.
MUD COSTS

CHANGED

HOOKLOAD PICKUP WEIGHT SLACKOFF ROTATING

RIG SAFETY DAYS

INSPECTION  BY / TITLE

SAFETY RATE

OFFICE NOTIFIED

FROM TO CODE RPM W.O.B.
DEPTH  DRILLED

LAST MEETING DATE

RELEASE DATE / TIME

AVERAGE KVA

DISTRIBUTOR
BLOWDOWN
VOLUMES

M
U

D
O

PS
SA

FE
TY

HTHP FL HTTP FC

TI
M

E 
LO

G

ROTARY TORQUE

pH MF PF CALCIUM CHLORIDES% SOLIDS % LCM % OIL% SAND % H2OMud Type

SHAKER TYPE SCREENSCENTRIFUGES

PU
M

PS
R

EN
TA

L 
IT

EM
S

OPERATORS REPRESENTATIVE

COUNTY / PARISH

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CO. MAN PH NO.

B
O

IL
ER

STDBY HRLYDESCRIPTION DAY RT

Depth GPM PRESSURE
Pump 1

Liner SPM
Pump 2

Liner SPM
Pump 3

Liner SPM
Pump 4

Liner SPM Pump 1
Pump 2

Pump 3
Pump 4

TYPE STROKE HRS Total HRS MAX PSI KILL (SPM)Manufacturer SPR
Kill Rate

CAPSTAR DRILLING, LP (WY) 2020-08-31 312 Re-Entry

AMOCO-WESTAN-CAVANAUGH#1 NE NE SEC 08, T004S, R64W 08/18/20 19:45 8300.00

CRESTONE PEAK RESOURCES, LLC Adams CO 08/16/20 12:00 14.75

12.43

08/28/20

TRACY EKLUND 307-797-8547 DEREK DUPEE 720-398-1700 46 Degrees & Cloudy

WAIT ON CEMENT,FLOW CHECK, NO FLOW/ L.D.D.P. FOR WIRELINE RIH & Tag Plug//Set top plug//WOC//RIH & Tag Plug

None 0 1874 N 39.7229 W -104.567

Tong & Boom Ops//Cementing//Pinch Points//Teamwork 0 08/29/20 08/29/20 06:30

08/18/20 CORY C - MNGR 100.00

08/21/20 250/3000

08/26/20 08:00 - 90 SEC

08/26/20 22:00 - 90 SEC

0.00

 -

7.00 644.54

12:00 10.9 47

Water/Polymer

Fluid Pro Mongoose 2X140 2X120 No 238.00 238.00

06:00 11:00 5.00 12 WAIT ON PUMP TRUCK
11:00 12:00 1.00 12 SET CEMENT PLUG #1, 7235-6677', 20 BBLS FRESH, 39 BBL 15.8# 145 SKS, 1.52 YLD,

WATER 6.19, 4 BBL FRESH, 67 BBL MUD DISPLACEMENT
12:00 13:30 1.50 6 T.O.O.H. 14 STANDS SOPE BOOM AND L.D.D.P.
13:30 14:00 0.50 5 CONDITION MUD & CIRCULATE
14:00 14:30 0.50 6 T.O.O.H
14:30 15:00 0.50 7 RIG SERVICE X/O BOOM HOSE
15:00 17:00 2.00 6 T.O.O.H.
17:00 18:00 1.00 8 X/O BOOM PUMP & SNAIL ON MIXING PUMP
18:00 19:00 1.00 8 CONT TO X/O SNAIL ON MIXING PUMP
19:00 20:30 1.50 8 CONT WORKING ON SNAIL
20:30 21:00 0.50 6 LAY DOWN 22 JTS, DEPTH OF 3228'
21:00 22:00 1.00 5 CIRCULATE HOLE S.M. W/ CEMENTERS/ CEMENT PLUG #2,20BBLS WATER AHEAD, 23.5BBLS

OF 15.8PPG CEMENT YIELD 1.15, MIX RATIO 5.0, DISPLACE WITH 2.5BBLS OF FRESH
WATER AND 30BBLS OF 10.9PPG MUD, PLUG BALANCED.

22:00 23:30 1.50 6 CEMENT PLUG #2 3287-3007',PULL 13JOINTS CIRCULATE PIPE CAP. CONINUE TRIPPING
OUT 27 JOINTS

23:30 00:00 0.50 5 CIRCULATE
00:00 00:30 0.50 12 CEMENT PLUG #3 , 1985-1448', 20 BBLS FRESH, 75 BBL 15.8# 350 SK, YLD 1.21 WATER

5.13, 2 BBLS WATER , 11 BBL MUD DISPLACEMENT
00:30 06:00 5.50 13 WAIT ON CEMENT,FLOW CHECK, NO FLOW/ L.D.D.P. FOR WIRELINE

PJSM W/ STS WIRELINE, RIG UP AND RUN CBL LOG TO 640'

16.00
1.50

66.25

2.00 68.50
6.00 60.75
0.50 2.50
3.50 37.00

1.00

2.50
6.50 15.50
5.50 22.00

19.00
18.00

21: 5.50
22:
23:
Other

24.00 336.00

 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50
 - 6.50 6.50

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

PZ-8 8.00 GARDNER DENVER

4.00 14.00 S-135 4.753.5 X/H 273 0 273 0 Rig= (8) 6.5
" DC's (238) 4" DP
Rental=
(6) 4.75" DC's
(35) 4" DP

1960.00
2430.00
530.00

7406.00
#2 Dyed

0
0

622.25
JACOB BOLD S.M. ON CMENTING, TEST COM @ 1200HRS
COLE SHANDORF S.M. ON CEMENTING/ TEST COM 2300 HRS ROT 31, UP
COLE SHANDORF 34, DWN 29, FUEL- LP- 1530, DH- 900, 2430 TOTAL

8-30-2020- 1700 Hrs- Lost one BBL drilling mud on the containment (Hole in Snail of Mixing Pump)(All Vaccuumed up). Running CBL this morning.

From Watkins Co head
south on exit295. Drive 1
turn east , drile 1.1 mile
turn south , Drive 1 mile
east turn north
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