Schneider Summiz Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY CPERATIONS REPORT

Date:

03/07/18 |  Operator:

Enerplus Resources

Well Name: |

Colorado State #3

Field:

Black Hollow | County:

Weld

[Consultant:

Mike & Kent

Phone: | 870-630-4051

Present Operation: |

Locate Well

Contractor & Rig No.:

Excell

Production Casing OD:

51/2" | Depth:

8,035

Wt:| 155&17 | Grade:

77 | PBID:| 9,035

Tubing OD:

_ N/A Wit: N/A

Grade: [ N/A

Coupling: | N/A _

Perfs: |

8,963' to 8,985'

Breakdown of Operations

From

To Hrs

10:00

18:00 8.0

JSA, Dig cut hole around marker jt to hot tap. Hot tap to ensure no pressure, cut of marker jL.

9 5/8 full of cement, cannot see 5 1/2 csg. Hammer 1' cement from 9 5/8 still no 5 1/2 csg

Dig out and hot tap 9 5/8 ¢sg. 0 psi cut a window in th 9 5/8 csg, stili no 5 1/2 ingide the & 5/8

Weld window cut in the 8 5/8 csg back to the 9 5/8. weld on marker it and backfill. WOO

8.0

Tubing Setting & BHA

Workover Cost

Qty

QD ID Description

Length Top

Intangibles

Daily Cumulative

Location

Rig Mobilization

Rig Day Work

Mud

Water

Cementing Services

Equipment Rentals

Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency (10%)

End of tubing

Total Costs

Bruingfon Engineering, Ltd. Reporting Sysfem

2/2010




Schnelder Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 04/30/19 |

Operator:

Enerplus Resources

Well Name: |

Colorado State #3

Field: Black Hollow

| County:

Weld

[Consultant:

Mike Henderson

Phone; |  970-830-4051

Present Operation: |

MIRU

Contractor & Rig No.:

Excell Rig #

Production Casing OD:

5-1/2" | Depth:

9,035

wt:| 155&17 | Grade:

77 | PBID:] 6,035

Tubing OD: | N/A

Wi: N/A

Grade: _

N/A

Coupling: |  NA |

Perfs: |

8,963 to 8,985

Breakdown of Operations

From To Hrs

1000 1100 1.0

had o wait on land owner to allow us permision

1100 1130 0.5

JSA

1130 1400 2.5

remove well marker preped casing pieced up extention welded in back filled hole and leveled

out shutdown

4.0

Tubing Setting & BHA

Workover Cost

Qty oD 1D

Description

Length

Top

intangibles

Daily Cumulative

Location

Rig Mobilization

Rig Day Work

Mud

Water

Cementing Services

Equipment Rentals

Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency {10%)

End of tubing

Total Costs

Bruington Engineeting, Lid. Reporting System

2/2010




Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 283038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date;

05/04/19 |

Operator:

Enerplus Resources

Well Name: |

Colorado State #3

Field:

Black Hellow

[ County:

Weld

[Consultant:

Mike Henderson

Phone: |  970-530-4051

Present Operation: |

Contractor & Rig No.:

Exceli Rig #

Production Casing OD:

5-1/2" | Depth:

9,035'

wt:| 155&17 | Grade:

?? | PBTD:| 9,035

Tubing OD:

N/A

Wi: N/A

Grade: _

N/A

Coupling: ! N/A _

Perfs: |

8,963 to 8,885

Breakdown of Operations

From

To

Hrs

0800

1

530

7.5

moved rig to location spoted in padded up started riging up had a seal go out on the rig

stoped riging up dug out from around well head installed surface flange secured well

cleaned location and shut down

7.5

Tubing Setting & BHA

Workover Cost

Qty

ab

Description

Length

Top

Intangibles

Daily Cumulative

Location

Rig Mobilization

Rig Day Work

Mud

Water

Cementing Services

Equipment Reniais

Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Weilhead

Contingency (10%)

End of tubing

Total Costs

Bruingfon Engineering, Ltd. Reporting Systern

22010




/)

Schncider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date:

05/05/1¢ |

Qperator:

Enerplus Resources

Well Name: |

Colorado State #3

Field:

Biack Hollow

| County:

Weld

|Consuitant:

Mike Henderson

Phone: |  §70-530-4051

Present Operation:|

Contractor & Rig No.:

Excell Rig #

Production Casing Ob:

5-1/2" | Depth:

8,035’

Wt.:! 155&17 | Grade:

?7 | PBTD:] 9,035

A:Umsm OD:

N/A

WVt N/A

Grade: |

N/A

Coupling: |  NA |

Perfs: |

8,863 to 8,935

Breakdown of Operations

From

To

Hrs

Tubing Setting & BHA

Workover Cost

Qty

oD

Description

Length

Top

Intangibles

Daily Cumulative

Location

Rig Mobilization

Rig Day Work

Mud

Water

Cementing Services

Equipment Rentals

Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency {10%)

End of tubing

Total Costs

Bruington Enginesring, Lid. Reporting System

2/2010
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Schneider Sumimit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date:

05/06/19 |

Operator:

Enerplus Resources

Well Name: |

Colorado State #3

Field:

Black Hollow

| County:

Weld

|Consultant:

Mike Henderson

Phone: |  970-630-4051

Present Operation:|

Contractor & Rig No.:

Excell Rig #

Production Casing OD:

5-1/2"

Depth:

9,035’

wt:| 155&17 | Grade:

?? | PBTD:] 9,035

Tubing OD:

“

N/A

Wit

N/A

Grade: |

N/A

Coupling: [ N/A |

Perfs: |

8,963 to 8,985

Breakdown of Operations

From

To

Hrs

1100

1330

2.5

rig fixed started %o rig up seen front rig pads sinking do to soft ground riged down added

more dirt and extra pads

1330

1400

0.5

RU rig started setting up for washdown

1400

RU pumpé&tark D.C.BHA ,and power swivel locked BOP cleaned tcols and location

1730

3.5

shutdown

6.9

Tubing Setting & BHA

Workover Cost

Qty

ab

Descripticn

Length

Teop

Intangibles

Daily Cumulative

Location

Rig Mobilization

Rig Day Work

Mud

Water

Cementing Services

Egquipment Rentals

Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transporiation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency (10%)

End of tubing

Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, Lid. Reporting System

2/2010




Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/07/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Weil Name: | Colorade State #3
Field: Black Hollow | County: Weld |Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: |  970-630-4051
Present Operation:| Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035’ Wt.: | 155&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:| 8,035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wt: N/A_ | Grade:] N/A [Coupling: | NA | Perfs: | 8,963 to 8,985'
Breakdown of Operations
From To Hrs
0700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting
0730 0800 0.5 |safety check equipment
0800 0900 1.0 |RU swivel to D.C. and BHA
0800 0930 0.5 |pressure test all pump lines to 2000 PSI including swivel with kelly cock
0930 established circulation actual drili 7'-8' felt we hit metal suspect 5 1/2 called Greg jarell
1000 0.5 |was instructed to clear water from well to get visual of suspected 5 1/2
1000 1030 0.5 |cleared water from well to locate 5 172
1030 removead washington rubber pulled out of hole still 4" of water left in the well can not see
5 1/2 called Greg Jarell was instructed to romove 6 1/4 bit and BHA replace with a 4 3/4 rock
1100 0.5 bit
1100 1230 1.5 jwait on bit sub
1230 1300 0.5 |made up 4 3/4 kit and bit sub installed washington rubber establish circulation
1300 1400 1.0 |started working our way into the 5 1/2 couldn't get inside of supposed 5 1/2
1400 1430 0.5 |cleared water from well to locate 5 1/2
1430 1500 0.5 [|pulled bit from well to much water remained in hole to see the bottom
1500 15630 0.5 |secured well and shut down
8.5
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD ID Description Length Top Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 61/4 5 1/4 rock bit 1.00 1.00|Location
1 41/ bit sub 170 2.70|Rig Mobilization
1 3z X0 1.10 3.80|Rig Day Work
1 318 D.C. 28.02 31.82{Mud
Water
Cementing Services
Equipment Rentais
Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibles
Tubing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency (10%)
End of tubing Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, Ltd. Reporting System 2/2010




Schneidar Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/08/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorads State #3
Field: Black Hollow | County: Weld [Consultant: Mike Hendersen Phone: | 870-630-4051
Present O_um_,mzozn_ Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035' Wt:| 155&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:]| 8,035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wi: N/A | Grade:| N/A |Coupling: | NA | Perfs: | 8,963 to 8,985
Breakdown of Operations
From To Hrs
0700 0730 0.5 safely meeting
0730 0800 0.5 |clear water from well with water truck located 5 1/2 set up tapper mill
08C0 0900 1.¢  |broke circulation started milling a pilot hole into 5 1/2 milled from 9" {0 14
08C0 clear water from well with air to make sure we had the proper pilct hole going into the 5 1/2
0930 0.5 |couldn't see due to water still left in the well
0930 1000 0.5 |removed tapperd mill put on 4 3/4 rock bit
1000 installed washington rubber made several attempts fo make it in the 5 1/2 we couldn't make
1100 1.0 lin puiled cut of hole instalied a 3 7/8 bit TIH
1100 1230 1.5 |gotinto & 1/2 with 3 7/8 bit actual drill from 14'-25' fell thru rolled hole clean
1230 called Greg Jarell it was decided to stay with the 3 7/8 bit but add a string mill on top of the
1530 3.0 |D.C.had to wait on string mil! racked swevil back picked up D.C.#2 TiH
1530 installed string mill stacked out at §1' tried rotating down it would just stall out pulled up
romoved mill ri swevil and 1 jnt of tubing started circulating well and drilling out we wera
1630 1.0 |getting cloth like material and wood broke locse at 76" made it to 92 called Greg Jarell
1630 was instructed to TOOH to check the bit RD swevil removed washington rubber TOOM
1730 1.0 }1-nt2-D.C.1-3 7/8 rock bit
1730 inspect bit and was clean and clear due to freezing overnight drained pump and fines
1830 1.0 {cleaned locarion and shut down

11.5
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD 1D Description Length Top |Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 37/8 rock bit 0.30 0.30|Location
1 3178 Bit sub 1.32 1.62{Rig Mobhilization
2 3148 D.C. 55.86 57.78| Rig Day Work
1 3172 %@ sub 1.07 58.05|Mud
1 312 top sub 1,03 59.85 Water
1 27/8 2 7/8 tubing 31.52 81.40|Cementing Services
Equipment Rentals
Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perl.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency (10%)

End of tubing 81.40iTotal Costs

Bruington Engineering, Ltd. Reporting System 2/2010




Schncider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/09/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3
Field: 12 | County: Weld [Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: |  §70-630-4051
Present Operation:| Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,038' Wt:| 15.5&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:| 9,035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wit: N/A | Grade: | N/A [Coupling: | N/A | Perfs: | 8,963 tc 8,985'
Breakdown of Cperations
From Te Hrs
G700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting
0730 0800 0.5 iequipment safety check put pumpé&line together
0800 checked well pressure OPSI openad BCP's TIH with bit and D.C.installed string mill and XO
0900 1.0 |subs RU swevil and jnt installed washington rubber
0900 started pumping broke circulation started milling cement shelf that's apove the 5 1/2
1030 1.5 |because the string mill wouldn't fit into the 5 1/2 finaly fell into the 5 1/2
1030 1100 0.5 |driiling out leftover cement left on the walls of the 5 1/2
1100 tallied row of tuking made conection with swevil to see if tubing would go with out drilling
1200 1.0 |pipe would just stack cut had to pump and swevil every jnt down made it to 191
1200 1230 0.5 |actual drill from 181-285
1230 1300 0.5 {warm up and lunch
1300 1400 1.0 |actuai drill from 285™-375' had to work pipe a lot thru this area do pressuring up
1400 actual drill from 375-587" ran the last 3 jnis of pipe with no pump decided to hang swevil
1500 1.0 |and TIH normally
1500 set up pump to suck displacment to tank started picking up tubing and triping in hole to
15800 1.0 |1,088' had to rcle hole due to tubing floating in
1800 1630 0.5 [rolled hole clean getting cloth material and cement cuttings
1630 set up pump to suck displacment tc tank started picking up tubing and triping in hole to
1730 1.0 |1508'
1730 1830 1.0 |continued picking up and triping tubing in making it to a depth of 31471
1830 1900 0.5 |drained pump and lines secured well cleanzd tools and location shut down
12.0
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD 1D Description Length Top Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 37/8 rock bit 0.30 0.30!Location
1 318 bit sub 1.32 1.62;Rig Mohbilization
2 31/8 D.C 55.86 57.78\Rig Day Work
1 31z %0 sUb 1.32 59.10|Mud
1 3172 x0 sub 1.52 80.62| Water
1 43/4 string milt 3.74 64.36| Cementing Services
1 31/2 top sub 1.05 85.14| Equipment Rentals
98 278 2 7/8 tubing 3075.92| 3141.06|Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibies
Tubing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency {10%)
End of tubing 3141.06| Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, Ltd. Reporting System 2/2010




Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038

rd Park City, UT 84098
Schneidor Summit Scrvlces
DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT
Date: | 05/10/19 | Operator:; Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3
Field: 12 | County: Weld |Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: | §70-630-4051
Present Operation:| Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035' Wt:| 155&17 | Grade: ?? {PBTD:| 9,035
Tubing OD:_| N/A Wt: N/A_ | Grade:| N/A [Coupling: |  N/A | Perfs: | 8,963' to 8,985'
Breakdown of Operations
From To Hrs
0700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting
0730 0800 0.5 |safety check equipment put pump and lines together
0800 0830 0.5 [reverse circulated well @ 3141
0830 riged down circulating line hooked up pump to suck displacment opened BOP's staried TIH
0930 1.0 [|with tubing depth was 3857
0930 1030 1.0 |continued triping in hole depth @ 4894
1030 1130 1.0 |continued triping in hole depth @ 5708 had to stop and rol! hele do to the tubing fleating in
1130 1230 1.0 [reverse circulated well @ 5708 rolled clean and lunch
1230 riged down circulating line hooked up pump to suck displacment started TIH with fubing
1400 1.5 imaking it a depth of 89771
1400 1530 1.5 ireverse circulated well at 6871' well was clean riged down circulating fines
15630 set up to TOOH with tubing and BHA remcved washingion rubber tooh 217-2 7/8 tubing
1830 3.0 1-4 3/4 string mill 2-3 1/8 D.C. 1-3 7/8 rock bit
1830 100 0.5 |secured well broke down pump and lines cleaned location and shut down
12.0
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD 1D Description Length Top |intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 37/8 rock bit 0.30 0.30|Location
1 3158 bit sub 1.32 1.62|Rig Mobilization
2 31/8 D.C. 55.86 57.78|Rig Day Work
1 31 xo sub 1.32 59.10| Mud
1 31/2 X0 sub 1.52 60.62| Water
1 4344 string mill 3.74 64.36| Cementing Services
1 3172 top sub 1.05 65.14| Equipment Rentals
217 | 278 2 718 tubing 6805.69| 6806.59|Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibles
Tubing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency (10%)
End of tubing 6871.83| Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, Ltd. Reporting Systern 2/2010




Schieider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
, Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/11/19 | Cperator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3
Field: 12 | County: Weld [Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: | 970-630-4051
Present Operation:| Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035 Wt:| 155&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:| 9,035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wt N/A_| Grade: ] N/A_{Coupling: | N/A | Perfs: | 8,963 to 8,985’
Breakdown of Operations
From To Hrs
0700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting with rig crew and wireline group
0730 0800 0.5 |equipment safety check RU wireline
0800 stack out plug at 3100 fried severa timas to make it through called Greg Jarell was
{0800 1.0 |insructed come out of hole with wireline and rig down and release fruck
0900 0830 0.5 |wait on 5 1/2 hydro mechanical ridge plug
0930 1100 1.5 |[plug arrived TiH with 1-HBP 217-2 7/8 tubing RU pump fo roll hole
1100 1230 1.5 ireverse circulated hole clean
1230 1300 0.5 idroped pressure ball and lunch
1300 1330 0.5 |pressured up on tubing and set CIBP @ 68C6'
1330 1400 0.5 |reversed out tubing volume pressure tested casing to 500 PSI for 5 min and held
1400 1430 0.5 |broke down circulating lines set up to TOOH with tubing
1430 1830 2.0 |[TOOH with 217-2 7/8 tubing
1630 1700 0.5 |secured well cleaned location and tools shutdown
10.0
Tubing Setting & BHA Warkover Cost
Qty ap 1D Description Length Top Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 3va rock bit 0.30 0.30!Location
1 31/8 bit sub 1.32 1.62! Rig Mobilization
2 31/8 D.C. 55.86 57.78;Rig Day Work
1 3172 X0 sub 1.32 59.10{Mud
1 3172 %0 sub 1.52 60.62|Water
1 43/4 string mill 3.74 84.35| Cementing Services
1 312 top sub 1.05 65.14| Equipment Rentals
217 1278 2 7/8 tubing 6806.69| 6806.69|Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibles
Tubing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency (10%)
End of tubing 6871.83| Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, Lid. Reporiing System 2/2010
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Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/12/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3
Field: 12 | County: Weld iConsultant: Mike Henderson Phone: |  970-630-4051
Present Onmqm:o:“_ Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035’ Wt.:| 155&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:| 9035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wit: Grade:| N/A [Coupling: |  NiA | Perfs: | 8,963 to §,985'
Breakdown of-Operations
From To Hrs
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD iD Description Length Top |Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 37/8 rock bit 0.30 0.30|L.ocation
1 31/8 bit sub 1.32 1.62|Rig Maobilization
2 31/8 D.C. 55.86 57.78|Rig Day Work
1 312 X0 sub 1.32 5¢.10{Mud
1 342 xo sub 1.52 s0.52| Water
1 43/4 string mill 3.74 84.35| Cementing Services
1 312 top sub 1.0 55.14| Equipment Rentals
217|278 2 7/8 tubing 6806.65| 6806.59|Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibles
Tuhbing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency {10%)
£nd of tubing 55871.83| Total Costs
Bruington Engineering, Ltd, Reporting System 2/2010




Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

Schneider Summit Services

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/13/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3

Field: 12 | County: Weld [Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: |  970-630-4051
Present Operation:] Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035' Wt:| 155&17 | Grade: ??7 | PBTD:| 9,038
Tubing OD: _| N/A Wit: N/A | Grade:! N/A |Coupling: | N/A | Perfs: | 8,963 to 8,985'

Breakdown of Operations

From To Hrs

0700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting with rig crew and wireline group

0730 RU wireline to dump baied 2 sacks of cement on plug RU 2by2 perfgun perforafing at

0800 1.8 {8790'-6789' RD wireline set up to TIH with tubing

0900 1100 2.0 |TIH with 1-CICR 215-2 7/8 setting CICR @ 6746.17

1100 1130 0.5 iwait on cement trucks

1130 1200 0.5 |safety meeting with rig crew and cementers and RU

1200 started pumping water for injection rate formation broke down @ 1300PSI pumped 25 sacks

under CICR after the 25 sacks pressure was at 3500P 8] stung out of CICR putting 10

1300 1.0 |sacks on top of CICR pressure was 0PS| RD cementers

1300 1330 0.5 |TOOH 750 to board and lunch

1330 1630 3.0 |TOOH laying down 191-2 7/8 tubing

1630 1700 0.5 |secure well clean locaticn and tools shutdown
10.0
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oo 1D Description Length Top Intangibles Daily Cumulative
1 37/8 rock bit 0.30 0.30|Location
1 a1/8 bit sub 1.32 1.62|Rig Mobilization
2 3178 D.C. 55.86 57.78|Rig Day Work
1 3172 Xa sub 1.32 59.10| Mud
1 31z X0 sub 1.52 80.62| Water
i 4 5/4 string mili 3.74 64.36| Cementing Services
1 3172 top sub 1.05 85.14| Equipment Rentals
217 |28 2 7/8 tubing 6806.69] 6806.69|Bits

Cased Hole Logs & Perf.

Wireline Services

Production Testing & BHP

Stimulation

Transportation

Supervision

Misc. Labor & Services

Tangibles

Tubing

Packer

Wellhead

Contingency (10%)}

End of tubing 6871.83; Total Costs

Bruington Engineering, L.td, Reporting System 2/2010



Schnetder Summit Serviges

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date: | 05/114/19 | Operator: Enerplus Resources Well Name: | Colorado State #3
Field: 12 | County: Weld [Consultant: Mike Henderson Phone: |  970-630-4051
Present Operation:| Contractor & Rig No.: Excell Rig #
Production Casing OD: 5-1/2" | Depth: 9,035' Wt.: | 155&17 | Grade: ?? | PBTD:| 9035
Tubing OD: | N/A Wt: N/A | Grade:| N/A [Coupling: [ NA | Perfs: | 8,963' o §,985'
Breakdown of Operations
From To Hrs
0700 0730 0.5 |safety meeting with rig crew and wireline group
0730 RU wireline ran in hole setting CIBP @ 750" triped out setting up dumpbaler made 2 runs
dumping 5 sacks on CIBP lay down baler set perf gun TIH perforated @ 730'-731" with
0830 1.0 |dspf TOOH set up 3 1/2 CICR TIH setting CICR @ 710’
0830 0800 0.5 |TIH 1-retainer stinger 23-2 7/8 spaced out tubing with a 10" sub
0900 1030 10.5 |wait on cementers
1030 1100 0.5 |safety meeting with rig crew and cementers
1100 RU cementers established injecticn rate 320PS| @ 2 BBLS per min siarted pumping
cement pumped 150 sacks of cement under CICR ending pump pressure was 2300PS|
- 1200 1.0 [stung out of retainer pumped 78 sacks to surface RD cementers
1200 1230 0.5 |TOOH 1-10 sub 23-2 7/8 tubing 1-retainer stinger
1230 1300 0.5 |lunch
1300 cleaning rig equipment and bop's of cement
15.0
Tubing Setting & BHA Workover Cost
Qty oD D Description Length Top Intangibles Gaily Cumulative
1 37/8 rack bit 0.30 0.30|Location
1 31/8 bit sub 1.32 1.62| Rig Mobilization
2 31/8 p.C. 55.86 57.78| Rig Day Work
1 31/2 xo sub 1.32 59.10( Miud
1 3172 %0 sub 1.52 80.62| Water
1 4344 string mill 3.74 84.36| Cementing Services
1 3152 top sub 1.05 85.14| Equipment Rentals
217 1278 2 748 tubing 6806.69 6806.69|Bits
Cased Hole Logs & Perf.
Wireline Services
Production Testing & BHP
Stimulation
Transportation
Supervision
Misc. Labor & Services
Tangibles
Tubing
Packer
Wellhead
Contingency (10%)
End of tubing 6871.83| Total Costs
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