

**US ROCKIES REGION**  
**Operation Summary Report**

Well: **PARAGON X30-06**

Spud date: 2/18/2009

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: PARAGON X30-06

Rig name no.: SPN 721/721

Event: CONST- CAP WELL WORK

Start date: 1/25/2019

End date:

Active datum: RKB @4,990.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI:

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
1/25/2019	13:30 - 14:30	1.00	MIRU	30	A	P		ROAD RIG AND EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION.
	14:30 - 16:30	2.00	MIRU	30	A	P		TP-1720 PSI, CP-1720 PSI, SCP-0 PSI, R/U RIG PUMP AND LINER TO WELLHEAD, SDFN.
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	MIRU	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD
1/26/2019	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING TO REVIEW JSA AND DAY TASK.
	7:00 - 14:30	7.50	WO/REP	30	E	P		TP-1720 PSI, CP-1720 PSI, SLOWLY BLOW DOWN WELL TO WORK TANK, SUMMIT TESTING PRESSURE TEST BLIND AND PIPE RAMS TO 500 PSI LOW AND 5000 PSI HIGH WHILE BLOWING DOWN WELL, CIRCULATE GAS OUT WITH 160 BBLs OF WATER.
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	F	P		N/D TOP FLANGE, N/U BOP AND TBG EQUIPMENT.
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	WO/REP	31	I	P		TALLY TOOH W/140 JTS OF 2.375 TBG, SWI, DRAIN EQUIPMENT, SDFWE.
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD
1/28/2019	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING
	7:00 - 9:00	2.00	WO/REP	46	C	P		TP-0 PSI, CP-0 PSI, SCP-0 PSI, HELD A SAFETY STAND DOWN AND DISCUSS WIND CONDITIONS, WIND GAUGE READ 31 MPH, CREW DIDN'T FEEL COMFORTABLE TO WORK, WAIT TILL 9 AM TO SEE IF WIND DIE WITH NO SUCCESS, DECISION WAS MADE TO SHUT DOWN FOR DAY.
1/29/2019	9:00 - 9:30	0.50	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	WO/REP	30	G	P		TRAVEL TO LOCATION
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	WO/REP	48	B	P		JSA MEETING, RIG INSPECTION
	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	WO/REP	31	I	P		FINISH TOOH
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	WO/REP	34	1	P		<b>MIRU WL</b>
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00	WO/REP	34	O	P		RIH TO 7470' WITH GR, POOH
	9:30 - 10:30	1.00	WO/REP	34	I	P		RIH TO 7080', CIBP WOULD NOT SET, POOH
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	WO/REP	34	I	P		SWAPPED DRUMS ON WL TRUCK, <b>RIH TO 7080' SET CIBP</b> , POOH
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	WO/REP	34	D	P		<b>RIH AND DB 2 SX CEMENT ON PLUG</b> , POOH
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	WO/REP	34	1	P		RDMO WL
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	J	P		ND BOP, INSTALL NEW WH,
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	WO/REP	30	F	P		NU BOP
	14:00 - 17:00	3.00	WO/REP	31	I	P		TIH TO 7025'
17:00 - 17:30	0.50	WO/REP	30	I	P		DRAIN PUMP AND LINES, SECURE WELL, SDFD	
17:30 - 18:00	0.50	WO/REP	30	G	P		TRAVEL TO SHOP	
1/30/2019	0:00 - 0:00	0.00	COMP	52	I	P		SFC 0 PSI, CSG 0 PSI, TBG 0 PSI, LET SFC OPEN DURING WORK OPERATION, NO GAS NO FLUID
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50		30	G	P		TRAVEL TO LOC
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50		48	B	P		HELD JSA/SAFETY MEETING (SEE SAFETY COMM. ON SAFETY TAB)
	7:00 - 7:30	0.50		30	M	P		INSPECT AND WARM UP EQUIPMENT
	7:30 - 8:30	1.00		31	H	P		ESTABLISH CIRC. AND CIRCULATE GAS OUT, PT CSG TO 500 PSI FOR 15 MIN

US ROCKIES REGION  
**Operation Summary Report**

Well: PARAGON X30-06		Spud date: 2/18/2009	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: PARAGON X30-06	Rig name no.: SPN 721/721
Event: CONST- CAP WELL WORK		Start date: 1/25/2019	End date:
Active datum: RKB @4,990.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI:	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00		31	Y	P		BROACH TBG TO XN @ 7025' W/ 1,90 BROACH
	9:30 - 10:30	1.00		30	J	P		ND BOPS, NU WELL HEAD
	10:30 - 12:00	1.50		46	E	P		WAITED ON SECONDARY 2-1/16 5000K MASTER VALVE AND HYDROTESTER
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50		52	G	P		PRESSURE TEST WELL HEAD TO 5000 PSI AND 250 PSI FOR 15 MIN EACH
	12:30 - 14:00	1.50		30	C	P		RDMO RACK UP PUMP AND TANK CLEAN UP LOC.