Jodi Keeler

I . — M B e
From: Jodi Keeler

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 2:36 PM

To: 'Craig Burger - DNR'

Subject: RE: Routt County Gathering/Processing and Electric Generation Pricing Detail

Craig,

You should have received extended gas analyses for each of the three wells. But yes, collecting new samples with an
H2S analysis is workable. Thank so much!

Jodi Keeler

Production/Marketing Manager
ANTELOPE ENERGY COMPANY, LLC
P.C. Box 577

Kimball, NE 69145

308.235.4661 -0

308.235.4550-F

From: Craig Burger - DNR [mailto:Craig.Burger@state.co.us]

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 12:17 PM

To: Jodi Keeler

Subject: RE: Routt County Gathering/Processing and Electric Generation Pricing Detail

Jodi,
It looks like only the State 1-15 gas was analyzed and the date was back in 2012. We would like a new analysis when
flaring begins {including H2S).How about if | change the wording of COA #5 to this:

.5} Within 30 days of commencement of flaring: collect a new gas sample for laboratory analysis including hydrogen
sulfide and submit a new Form 4 with the laboratory results. Analysis attachments to the new Form 4 shall be a PDF
copy of the laboratory data sheet and an Electronic Data Deliverable
(EDD) prepared by the laboratory in the format specified on COGCC's website, located in Help => Environmental =>
COGCC EDD Information.

If you have any questions about the EDD please contact Arthor Koepsell at
{303) 894-2100 x5148 arthur.koepsell@state.co.us

Thanks,

Craig Burger, P.E.
Northwest Area Engineer

P 970.625.2497 Ext.2 | F970.625.5682 | C 970-319-4194
796 Megan Ave., Suite 201, Rifle, CO 81650 craig.burger@state.co.us | www.colorado.gov/cogcc
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-—---Original Message--—-

From: Jodi Keeler [mailto:jodik@antelope-energy.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2016 2:02 PM

To: Craig Burger - DNR

Subject: RE: Routt County Gathering/Processing and Electric Generation Pricing Detail

Craig,

| am a little unclear about the EDD format for the gas analyses. Are you requesting the EDD of the analyses we
submitted with our request, or are you reguesting new analyses with the data submitted by EDD?

Thanks for your clarification on this. We have not begun to set equipment and have not collected new samples.

Jodi Keeler

Production/Marketing Manager
ANTELOPE ENERGY COMPANY, LLC
P.0. Box 577

Kimball, NE 69145

308.235.4661 -0

308,235.4550 - F

From: Craig Burger - DNR [mailto:Craig.Burger@state.co.us)

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2016 2:58 PM

To: lodi Keeler

Subject: RE: Routt County Gathering/Processing and Electric Generation Pricing Detail

Thanks Jodi,

The Conditions of Approval on the sundries are:

1) Comply with all requirements of Rule 912, including monthly reporting of flared volumes {on Form 7) and notifications
to local emergency dispatch or the local government designee.

2) Submit annual updates {requests to flare) to COGCC on Form 4s (Sundry Notices},including all information specified in
'COGCC's "Notice to Operators, Rule 912 Venting or Flaring Produced Natural Gas - Statewide."

3) Comply with any Colorado Department of Public Health and Environment, Air Pollution Control Division rules or
requirements for all aimospheric discharges.

4) An enclosed flare shall be used, unless an open flare is specifically allowed by CDOPHE’s Regulation 7.

5) Within 30 days of approval of this form, submit an Electronic Data Deliverable (EDD), prepared by the laboratory that
performed the gas analysis attached to this form. The EDD shall be submitted with a new Form 4, in the format

specified on COGCC’s website, located in Help => Environmental => COGCC EDD Information.

Let me know if you have trouble getting your fab to provide #5. We are trying to get the data submitted electronically, it
is an ongoing process.




Craig Burger, P.E.
Northwest Area Engineer

P 970.625.2497 Ext.2 | F 970.625.5682 | C 970-319-4194
796 Megan Ave., Suite 201, Rifle, CO 81650 craig.burger@state.co.us | www.colorado.gov/cogcc

From: Jodi Keeler [mailto:jodik@antelope-energy.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2016 3:50 PM

To: Craig Burger - DNR (craig.burger@state.co.us)

Subject: FW: Routt County Gathering/Processing and Electric Generation Pricing Detail

Craig,

Per your request, we are attaching the detailed pricing information for gathering and processing gas and generating
electricity from the natural gas. We have not been able to confirm a market for generated electricity in the area. But
our visit to the field resulted in observing the nearest 3-phase power lines are 2 miles from the Breeze 11-8 well,

Thank you for your consideration and please contact me if you require anything further. The CDPHE will not grandfather
the equipment on location, so they are requiring enclosed flares. Upon COGCC approval,

ECDs would be installed and permitted with CDPHE in due course. We are

still hoping to have your approval and the equipment installed before the snow flies.

Jodi Keeler

Production/Marketing Manager
ANTELOPE ENERGY COMPANY, LLC
P.0O. Box 577

Kimball, NE 69145

308.235.4661 -0

308.235.4550-F

From: copier@antelope-energy.com [mailto:copier@antelope-energy.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2016 1:53 PM

To: Jodi Keeler

Subject: Message from "RNP0026738C0133"

This E-mail was sent from "RNP0026738C0133" (MP C3003).

Scan Date: 08.16.2016 15:53:25 (-0400)
Queries to: copier@antelope-energy.com




Resourcelogic, LLC-Land Management Consulting and Contracting
188 Tiabi Drive

Resourcelogicllc@gmail.com

970-629-9979

May 8, 2017

Rick Kirby

Antelope Energy Company
P.O. Box 577

Kimball, Nebraska 69145

RE: Involce #1706—Weed Contro}

Dear Rick:
Please consider this letter an invaice for spring weed control completed on three well sites and
roads in Routt County, Colorado on May 8, 2017. Weed control target species were Canada

thistle, Houndstongue, Dalmaion toadflax, and Leafy spurge.

Mobilization, Labor & Equipment for Spraying

7.5 Hours at 498 per Hour D
Herbicides:

1-75 gal. Gator Loads @ gl Per Load

(tank mix rate; 1 oz, Escort/ac, 1 qt. Hardball/ac L]

Total Amount Due: ~HERAERD

Commercial applicators are licensed by the Colorado Department of Agriculture.License #--
20503,

If you have any questions or need additional information please contact me. Please make your
check payable to Resourcelogic LLC, Thanks for the work.

A Dale Thompso
Resourcelogic, LLC



Resourcelogic, LLC-Land Management Consulting and Contracting
188 Tiabi Drive

Resourcelogicllc@gmail.com
970-629-9979

September 15, 2016

Rick Kirby

Antelope Energy Company
P.O. Box 577

Kimball, Nebraska 69145

RE: Invoice #1621 —Weed Control

Dear Rick:
Please consider this letter an invoice for fall weed control completed on three well sites and
roads in Routt County, Colorado on September 7, 2016. Weed control target species were

Canada thistle, Houndstongue, Dalmaion toadflax, and Leafy spurge.

Mobilization, Labor & Equipment for Spraving

7 Hours at @ per Hour L)
Herbicides:
1-75 gal. Gator Loads @ i Per Load ]

(tank mix rate-6 oz. Milestone/ac, 2pints Activator)

Total Amount Due: D

Commercial applicators are licensed by the Colorado Department of Agriculture.License #--
20503,

If you have any questions or need additional information please contact me. Please make your

check payabie to Resourcelogic LLC. Thanks for the work.

Sincerely;

A Dale Thompson
Resourcelogic, LLC
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Resourcelogic, LLC-Land Management Consulting and Contracting
P,O. Box 130, Craig, CO 81625
Resourcelogicllc@gmail.com

970-629-9979
September 11, 2015
Rick Kirby
Antelope Energy Company
P.O. Box 577
Kimball, Nebraska 69145
RE: Invoice #1516—Weed Control
Dear Rick:
Please consider this letter an invoice for fall weed control completed on three well sites and

roads in Routt County, Colorado on September 10, 2015. Weed control target species were
Canada thistle, Houndstongue, Dalmaion toadflax, and Leafy spurge.

Mobilization, Labor & Equipment for Spraving

7 Hours at§gilifper Hour b
Herbicides:
1-75 gal, Gator Loads @ Wl Per Load N

(tank mix rate-6 oz. Milestone/ac, 2pints Activator)

Total Amount Due; (RS
Commercial applicators are licensed by the Colorado Department of Agriculture.License #--
20503.

if you have any questions or need additional information please contact me. Please make your
check payable to Resourcelogic LLC. Thanks for the work.

Sincerel

A Dale Thompson
Resourcelogic, LLC
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Resourcelogic, LLC-Land Management Consulting and Contracting
P.0. Box 130, Craig, CO 81625

Resourcelogicllc@gmail.com

970-629-5979

May 19, 2015
Rick Kirby
Antelope Energy Company
P.0. Box 577
Kimball, Nebraska 69145
RE: Invoice #1504—Weed Control
Dear Rick:
Please consider this letter an invoice for weed control completed on three well sites and roads
in Routt County, Colorado on May 18, 2015. Weed control target species were Canada thistle,

Houndstongue, Dalmation toadfiax, and Leafy spurge.

Mobilization, Labor & Eguipment for Spraying

7 Hours a4l per Hour RN,
Herbicides:
2-75 gal. Gator Loads Gl Per Load S

(tank mix rate-1 oz. Escort/ac, 1pint 2,4-D/ac, 2pints Activator)

Total Amount Due:  SEENNED

Commercial applicators are licensed by the Colorado Department of Agriculture.License #--
20503,

If you have any questions or need additional information please contact me. Please make your
check payable to Resourcelogic LLC. Thanks for the work.

Sincerely,

%om

Resourcelogic, LLC

1




