

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: **UPRC 5-16O** Spud date: 12/28/1993
 Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13 Site: UPRC 5-16O Rig name no.: CONCORD 6/6
 Event: ABANDONMENT Start date: 2/15/2017 End date: 3/7/2017
 Active datum: RKB @4,925.00usft (above Mean Sea Level) UWI: SE/SE/0/2/N/66/W/5/0/0/6/PM/S/661.00/E/0/663.00/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
2/9/2017	-							
2/13/2017	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FORM 17 TEST
2/15/2017	0:00 -							TBG= 0 PSI PC=0 PSI BH= 0 PSI
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		TALKED TP CREW ABOUT BEING SAFE TRAVELING TO LOCATION WITH WINCH TRUCKS AND RIG. ALWAYS HAVE ASPOTTER WHEN BACKING EQUIPMENT INTO LOCATION.
	7:00 - 11:00	4.00	ABANDP	30	A	P		MIRU. SPOT IN BASE BEAM, WATER TANKS, MUD TANKS, PUMP, AND TBG TRAILOR INTO LOCATION.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		TIH WITH 3 MORE JTS OF 2.06" TBG AND CIRCULATE SAND OF OF RBP AT 6740'. AND RELEASE RBP.
	12:00 - 17:00	5.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH SB ALL TBG AND LD RBP. TIH AND CIRCULATE SAND OFF OF RBP AT 6870', RELEASE AND TOOH. SB ALL TBG.
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO YARD
2/16/2017	0:00 -							CSG= 500PSI BH= 0PSI
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION.
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		TALKED WITH CREW ABOUT BEING SAFE WHILE TIH. HELP SPOT IN WATER WHEN THE COME TO DROP OF FRESH WATER. ALSO WHEN WL ON LOCATION MUST HAVE RADIO SILENCE.
	7:00 - 10:30	3.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH WITH 3.5' 7.7# BIT AND SCRAPER TO LINER TOP AT 7088'. TOOH SB ALL TBG.
	10:30 - 13:30	3.00	ABANDP	34	I	P		RU WL. RIH AND SET 2.375" CIBP AT 7770' POOH. RIH AND DUMP BAIL 1 SK CEMENT ON PLUG. POOH. RIH AND SET 3.5" CIBP AT 7070' POOH. RDMO WL.
	13:30 - 15:30	2.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH AND TAG PLUG AT 7070'.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO YARD.
2/17/2017	0:00 -							BH= 0 PSI PC= 0 PSI
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION.
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		TALKED WITH CREW ABOUT PLANS FOR THE DAY, ALWAYS HELP SLB BACK TRUCKS INTO PLACE.
	7:00 - 9:00	2.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		CIRCULATED ON CIBP AND GOT FULL RETURNS. PT CASING TO 500 PSI TEST WAS GOOD.
	9:00 - 10:30	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		RU CEMENTERS. HELD JSA. PUMPED NIO PLUG: 15 SKS 4.1 BBL 15.8 PPG 1.53 YLD 0.5 BPM AND 600 PSI FULL RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB. EST TOC 6621'
	10:30 - 12:00	1.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH SB 4590' 2.06". LD REST OF TUBING.
	12:00 - 16:00	4.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU AND TIH WITH CIBP ON 2.06" TBG AND SET AT 4595'.
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO YARD.
2/21/2017	0:00 -							BH= 0 PSI PC= 0 PSI
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION.

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: UPRC 5-16O

Spud date: 12/28/1993

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: UPRC 5-16O

Rig name no.: CONCORD 6/6

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 2/15/2017

End date: 3/7/2017

Active datum: RKB @4,925.00usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: SE/SE/0/2/N/66/W/5/0/0/6/PM/S/661.00/E/0/663.00/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		TALKED WITH CREW ABOUT HIGH WIND SPEEDS SHUT DOWN IF IT GETS TOO BAD. TALKED ABOUT SLB AND HELPING BACK THEM INTO LOCATION. WL WILL BE ON LOCATION TODAY AND RADIO SILENCE IS NEEDED WHEN THEY ARE ON LOCATION.
	7:00 - 9:00	2.00	ABANDP	51	D	P		RU SLB. HELD JSA WITH CREW. PUMPED SUSSEX PLUG: 15 SKS, 1.53 YLD, 15.8 PPG EST TOC 4156' 1000 PSI AND 2.5 BPM FULL RETURNS DURING JOB.
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH SB 22 STANDS OF PIPE (1390') . LD THE REST OF THE PIPE.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDP	34	L	P		RU WL. RIH AND CUT CASING AT 1290' . POOH RDMO WL.
	11:00 - 12:30	1.50	ABANDP	30	F	P		UNLAND CASING AND STRIP BOP'S ONTO WELLHEAD. ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE BUT WAS GETTING HIGH PRESSURES. SHUT DOWN DUE TO WIND.
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	A	P		CREW TO YARD
2/22/2017	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION
	7:00 - 7:10	0.17	ABANDP	48	B	P		REVIEWED JSA, DISCUSSED TODAYS OPERATIONS, SEE SAFETY TAB.
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		RD 3.5' EQUIP, RU 2 1/16' EQUIP.
	8:30 - 13:00	4.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH W/ 45 JTS 2 1/16' TBG @ 1390', ATTEMPTED TO CIRC HOLE, LIMITED CIRC. TOOH W/11 STANDS EOT @ 708' GOT CIRC, WORKED 11 STANDS BACK DOWN WHILE CIRC HOLE W/ 240 BBLS WTR. LAYED DOWN 32 JTS 3.5' CSG 1290'.
	10:00 - 8:00		ABANDP	31	I	P		
	13:00 - 15:30	2.50	ABANDP	31	H	P		TIH TO 1390' WITH 2.06" TBG ATTEMPTED TO CIRCULATE BUT COULD NOT. WORKED PIPE COULD NOT GET CIRCULATION. SENT SLB TO NEXT JOB. DECIDED TO PUH TO INSIDE SC AND ATTEMPT TO CIRCULATE. GOT GOOD CIRCULATION. TIH ANOTHER 3 JT HAD TROUBLE GETTING CIRCULATION BUT FINALLY BROKE WHATEVER BRIDGE WAS BLOCKING US AND ALLOWED US TO GET CIRCULATION. CONTINUE TIH TO 1390' AND CONTINUED TO GET GOOD CIRCLUATION UNTIL CEMENT ARRIVED.
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	ABANDP	51	D	P		RU SLB. PUMP STUB PLUG. 315 SK 15.8 PPG 1.5 YLD. 700 PSI 1 BPM LOST CIRCULATION AFTER 60 BBLS. AFTER JOB WAS COMPLETED WE GOT 3 BBLS BACK. TOOH WET.
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH TO 100' LD REST. CIRCULATE CLEAN.
	18:00 - 18:00	0.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO YARD.
	18:00 - 18:00	0.00	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMPS AND LINES.
2/23/2017	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TO LOCATION
	7:00 - 7:15	0.25	ABANDP	48	B	P		DISCUSSED PLANNED ACTIVITY (SEE SAFETY TAB)
	7:15 - 7:45	0.50	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU PIONEER WL
	7:45 - 8:10	0.42	ABANDP	34	G	P		TAG STUB PLUG @ 633' FS.

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: UPRC 5-16O

Spud date: 12/28/1993

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: UPRC 5-16O

Rig name no.: CONCORD 6/6

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 2/15/2017

End date: 3/7/2017

Active datum: RKB @4,925.00usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: SE/SE/0/2/N/66/W/5/0/0/6/PM/S/661.00/E/0/663.00/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	8:10 - 8:25	0.25	ABANDP	34	I	P		RU EQUIP ON SURFACE RIH W/ 8 5/8 CIBP SET @ 80' FS. ROOH W/ WL TOOLS.
	8:25 - 8:40	0.25	ABANDP	34	1	P		RDMO PIONEER WL
	8:40 - 9:00	0.33	ABANDP	30	A	P		RDMO PU, ALL TANKS & PUMP. MOVE TO HSR-FULENWIDER 10-21.
3/7/2017	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	52		P		pressure tested CIBP, surface casing to 500 psi
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		dug up surface casing
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	C	P		cut casing 6' below GL., tagged @ 70'
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		filled casing stub with 37 bags 5000 psi
	15:00 - 16:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	A	P		capped casing with a metal plate containing well info
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		backfilled